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Reply to Brijwal et al

To the Editor—We thank Brijwal and 
colleagues for their letter on our study 
[1]. We also appreciate their insights and 
the valuable data reported in their letter. 
We agree that these new data from India 
affirm our finding of an apparent transi-
tion in the epidemiology of herpes sim-
plex virus type 1 (HSV-1) in Asia, with 
a growing role for this virus as a sexually 
transmitted infection. Such current data 
from India are very timely, given the pau-
city of data from this country, on both 
genital ulcer disease (GUD) and genital 
herpes.

We further seize this opportunity to 
highlight the unexplained (relatively) low 
seroprevalence in Indian-subcontinent 
populations [1–3]; the pooled mean sero-
prevalence in our study was estimated at 
93% in adults in China, but only at 67% 
in adults in India [1]. While the reason(s) 
behind the unexpectedly low seropreva-
lence in India remain unknown, this level 
of seroprevalence should logically entail 
considerable contribution for HSV-1 in 
GUD and genital herpes. A  significant 
fraction of youth should be reaching 
sexual debut uninfected, and thus poten-
tially at risk of acquiring HSV-1 sexually.

We could not, however, identify any 
recent and type-specific data from India 
for both GUD and genital herpes to 
validate this conjecture. We are thus 
delighted to see these newly reported data 
from India affirming a considerable role 
for HSV-1 in both GUD and genital her-
pes, and more so for first-episode genital 
herpes. We join Brijwal and colleagues in 
stressing the need for more studies and 
surveillance for HSV-1 seroprevalence 
as well as GUD and genital herpes, to 
clarify better HSV-1 transmission and to 
assess trends, in a context of an evolving 
epidemiology.
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